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Winner of the Harper Lee Prize for Legal Fiction

"If you liked The Help, you'll love this one!"--EW.com

In a novel that “brings authentic history to light,”* a young female attorney from New York City
attempts the impossible in 1946: attaining justice for a black man in the Deep South. 

Regina Robichard works for Thurgood Marshall, who receives an unusual letter asking the NAACP to
investigate the murder of a returning black war hero. It is signed by M. P. Calhoun, the most reclusive author
in the country.

As a child, Regina was captivated by Calhoun’s The Secret of Magic, a novel in which white and black
children played together in a magical forest. The book was a sensation, featured on the cover of Time
magazine, and banned more than any other book in the South. And then M.P. Calhoun disappeared.

With Thurgood’s permission, Regina heads down to Mississippi to find Calhoun and investigate the case.
But as she navigates the muddy waters of racism, relationships, and her own tragic past, she finds that
nothing in the South is as it seems.

Named one of four titles on the shortlist for this year’s Ernest J. Gaines Award for Literary Excellence,
awarded by the Baton Rouge Area Foundation
 
READERS GUIDE INCLUDED

*Augusta Trobaugh

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Rayes:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind
of book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you
want really feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the The
Secret of Magic is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Roxanne Pineda:

This book untitled The Secret of Magic to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, that is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this book in the
book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you
personally to past this publication from your list.

Dora Dickey:

The actual book The Secret of Magic will bring you to the new experience of reading a new book. The
author style to explain the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book you just read, this book very
appropriate to you. The book The Secret of Magic is much recommended to you to read. You can also get
the e-book from the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Timothy Lumpkin:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader with their story as
well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your young ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their talent in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them
is this The Secret of Magic.
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