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Myanmar, as Burma is now known, is strategically situated between the world’s two most populous
nations—China and India—and its distinctive ancient culture shares some traditions with both countries.
Hidden away from the eyes of the world for half a century by its military rulers’ policy of self-isolation, “the
Burmese Way to Socialism,” with a new democratic parliament and civilian government Myanmar is
undergoing important changes as it approaches its next elections in 2015. Its most famous political detainee,
Aung San Suu Kyi, the Nobel peace laureate, has been released after nearly twenty years of house arrest. The
present administration faces teething problems in politics, governance, education, its dealings with over a
hundred ethnic groups, and its society. At the same time, progress has been made with the emergence of a
free press, the release of political prisoners, and the reemergence of the long-lost voice of the man and
woman on the street. The country is opening up to tourism and business.
 
The Burmese people are by nature friendly and polite, and are traditionally easy-going and peaceable. Most
are devout Buddhists, and there are pagodas and meditation centers all over the country. They are also great
lovers of fun, entertainments, and festivals—in fact, there is a festival for each Myanmar calendar month
 
Culture Smart! Myanmar provides much needed information about a country taking its first steps to
becoming an important player on the world stage. It offers invaluable insights into the inner life of the
Burmese, their history, traditions, attitudes, and work ethic, and gives practical advice on what to expect and
how to behave in different circumstances. While their hosts may be naturally polite and accommodating,
foreign visitors will have to go through a steep learning curve to understand the dos and don’ts of Burmese
social customs. This book serves as an essential guide for Western tourists and entrepreneurs who are
interested in visiting or doing business in this beautiful, enigmatic, and resource-rich country.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Block:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to learn everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. How about the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will want this Myanmar - Culture Smart!: The Essential Guide to Customs & Culture.

David Wysocki:

The book Myanmar - Culture Smart!: The Essential Guide to Customs & Culture gives you the sense of
being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can
for being your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem with the subject. If you can make
examining a book Myanmar - Culture Smart!: The Essential Guide to Customs & Culture to become your
habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a
few or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open up and read a e-book Myanmar - Culture
Smart!: The Essential Guide to Customs & Culture. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or
encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Allie Littlefield:

The ability that you get from Myanmar - Culture Smart!: The Essential Guide to Customs & Culture may be
the more deep you digging the information that hide inside words the more you get thinking about reading it.
It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Myanmar - Culture Smart!: The Essential Guide to
Customs & Culture giving you joy feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way
that can be understood simply by anyone who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known
enough. This kind of book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then
can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this Myanmar
- Culture Smart!: The Essential Guide to Customs & Culture instantly.

Rhonda Kirby:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Myanmar - Culture
Smart!: The Essential Guide to Customs & Culture that give your fun preference will be satisfied by simply
reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world
far better then how they react towards the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the
geeky individual but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to start
examining as your good habit, it is possible to pick Myanmar - Culture Smart!: The Essential Guide to



Customs & Culture become your current starter.
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